FORESTRY ACT 2012

AMENDMENT NO. 3 TO THE INTEGRATED FORESTRY
OPERATIONS APPROVAL FOR SOUTH-WESTERN CYPRESS REGION

The Integrated Forestry Operations Approval for South-Western Cypress Region is
amended as set out in the Schedule to this instrument.

This instrument commences on the last day of signature below.
This instrument is made under section 69R of the Forestry Act 2072.

Notes do not form part of this instrument. They are provided to assist understanding only.

g N

Penny Sharpe MLC
Minister for Climate Change, Energy, the Environment, Heritage

Dated I?_(u [z5

Tara Moriarty MLC
Minister for Agriculture, Regional New Sou

owet o, -

ales, Western New South Wales




SCHEDULE —~ AMENDMENTS TO THE INTEGRATED FORESTRY
OPERATIONS APPROVAL FOR SOUTH-WESTERN CYPRESS REGJON

[1] Clause 3

Omit “31 December 2025" in clause 3 aﬁd insert instead, "31 December 2028,

[2] Clause 5

Omit "14.5 year period” in clause 5(2)(a) and insert instead, “17.5 year petiod”.

[3] Clause 5

Omit “14.5 year period"” in clause 5(2)(b) and insert instead, “17.5 year period”,



